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April 22, 2014 
 

 

The Honorable Board of 

Logan County Commissioners 

117 E. Columbus Avenue, Suite 100 

Bellefontaine, OH  43311 
 

Re: Liquid Bituminous and Asphalt Mix Bids 
2014 Construction Season 

 

Gentlemen: 
 

I have reviewed the bids received on April 22, 2014, for the above captioned materials shown on our bid 

specifications.  Attached is a tabulation of the bids received by your honorable board.  I offer the following 

comments concerning the bids: 
 

1. Asphalt Materials is low bidder on CM-90, MWS-90, HFRS-2, HFRS-2P, RS-2 and RS-2P. 

2. K-Tech Specialty Coatings was not low on any items. 

3. Shelly Materials is low bidder on 301,448T1 and 448T2 Hot Mix. 

     
 

In view of the above, I recommend that your honorable board accept all of the bids, authorizing us to buy from 

the lowest bidder for each grade of the material, and to purchase product from an alternate bidder, if the low 

bidder is unable to supply us with material on any given day and time.  This will allow us flexibility, depending 

on material and aggregate to be used on various projects. 
 

These materials will be purchased from Auto and Gas Funds. 
 

In accordance with ORC 9.24, we have checked the Auditor of State’s Unresolved Findings for Recovery 

Database.  All companies that bid were not listed and we have retained the certified search confirmation page 

in the project file. 
 

Respectfully submitted, 

 

 

Scott C. Coleman, P.E., P.S. 

Logan County Engineer 

 

SCC/hlg 

Attachment 



2014 LIQUID BITUMINOUS BID TABULATIONS 
 

($ / GALLON) 
 
 

 

 
MATERIAL 

 

ASPHALT 
MATERIALS 

 

MARATHON 
PETROLEUM 

 

SHELLY  
MATERIALS 

 

K-Tech 
Specialty 
Coatings 

 

Terry 
Asphalt 

Materials 

 
CM-90 

 
2.7475/GAL 

 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
 

 
MWS-90 1.84/GAL NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
1.89/GAL 

 

 
 

 
HFRS-2 1.84/GAL 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
1.89/GAL 

 

 
HFRS-2P 

(ODOT 
Spec.) 

2.04/GAL NO BID 
 

NO BID 

 
 

2.09/GAL 

 

 
RS-2 1.84/GAL NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
1.89/GAL 

 

 
RS-2P 2.04/GAL 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
2.09/GAL 

 

 
301 Hot Mix 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
54.50/TON 

 
NO BID 

 

 
402 Hot Mix 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
55.50/TON 

 
NO BID 

 

 
404 Hot Mix 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
63.50/TON 

 
NO BID 

 

 
HPM Cold 
Mix 

 
$85.00/TON 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 

 

 

 


